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The Toyota Venza is the 
all-Hybrid crossover 
that’s in a league of its 

own. 
Exclusively available as a 

Toyota Hybrid Electric 
Vehicle (HEV), it can make 
the best of every ride with a 
manufacturer-estimated 39 
combined MPG. 

Add in elegant crossover 
style, a tech-focused interi-
or, and standard Electronic 
On-Demand All Wheel Drive 
(AWD) and it’s a package 
that is both distinctive and 
practical. 

The 2024 Venza is avail-
able in LE, XLE, and Limited 
grades, as well as the 
uniquely stylish Nightshade 
edition. 

Based on the XLE trim 
level and available in three 
exterior colors, the Venza 
Nightshade features black-
out trim for a distinctive 
presence.

The Venza’s undeniably 
eye-catching design com-
bines with a fashionable, 
quiet cabin for a package 
that makes an impression. 
Its stunning alloy wheels, 
LED projector headlights, 
and continuous, thin rear 
LED taillights give Venza a 
strikingly modern look. The 
Toyota HEV System and 
standard AWD give it a 
blend of efficiency and utili-
ty that’s at home on long 
road trips or during inclem-
ent weather. 

NIGHTSHADE
The 2024 Venza 

Nightshade Edition is avail-
able in three premium exte-
rior colors – Celestial Black, 
Wind Chill Pearl or Ruby 
Flare Red, each boldly 
accented by an array of 
black trim for the interior. 
The Nightshade shows a 
true designer touch, starting 
with the acrylic front grille 
trim, black-painted outer 
mirror caps, door handles, 
rocker panels and available 
black roof rails. The lower 

bumpers are complemented 
in front and rear by smoked 
chrome moldings as well. 
The black shark fin antenna 
is a crowning touch.

All three colors of 2024 
Venza Nightshade Edition 
ride on 19-inch gloss-black 
multi-spoke aluminum alloy 
wheels. LED fog lamps, stan-
dard on XLE and 
Nightshade, shine bright 
through the darkness. For 
Nightshade specifically, this 
can also be paired with the 

available Star Gaze 
Panoramic Roof.

EFFICIENCY
The Toyota HEV System in 

the Venza combines a 
high-efficiency 2.5-liter 
DOHC four-cylinder engine 
with three electric motors 
and a lithium-ion battery in 
a highly compact system. 
The gas engine employs 
Variable Valve Timing-
intelligent system by 
Electric motor (VVT-iE) on 
the intake camshaft and 

VVT-i on the exhaust cam-
shaft. A variable cooling sys-
tem (electric water pump 
and electric thermostat) and 
a fully variable oil pump fur-
ther help improve engine 
efficiency.

Toyota’s proven hybrid 
tech seamlessly delivers 219 
total system horsepower for 
lively performance in the 
Venza. As with all Toyota 
hybrids, the feeling of every-
day acceleration and respon-
siveness is heightened by 
the way the electric motor 

boosts low-speed torque. 
The hybrid system optimizes 
the level of electric motor 
assistance and gas engine 
RPM without the engine 
running at high revs. Engine 
speed is synchronized with 
vehicle speed, yielding 
effortless and quiet acceler-
ation.

QUIET CABIN
The 2024 Venza provides 

a gratifyingly quiet cabin 
atmosphere. Critically, 
Toyota engineers focused on 
creating a calm interior con-
ducive to enjoying easy con-
versation or hearing music 
in clearer detail.

The high-strength 
TNGA-K platform is the first 
defense against noise intru-
sion, curbing vibration 
through the steering, floor 
and structure. Suspension 
tuning resists road surface 
disturbances, helping to 
reduce tire noise.

2024 TOYOTA VENZA

Sculpted Sophistication

The Toyota Venza is a tech-infused premium crossover with a standard hybrid powertrain.

CARGAZING

Base price: $35,070
Wheelbase: 105.9 in 
Length: 186.6 in. 
Width: 73 in. 
Height: 65.9 in. 
Power: 219  combined 
horsepower from hybrid 
system 
Transmission: 
Continuously variable
Estimated mileage: 40 
city, 37 highway

BY THE NUMBERS


